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Why do we have such extraordinarily powerful responses toward the images and pictures we see in everyday
life? Why do we behave as if pictures were alive, possessing the power to influence us, to demand things
from us, to persuade us, seduce us, or even lead us astray?

According to W. J. T. Mitchell, we need to reckon with images not just as inert objects that convey meaning
but as animated beings with desires, needs, appetites, demands, and drives of their own. What Do Pictures
Want? explores this idea and highlights Mitchell's innovative and profoundly influential thinking on picture
theory and the lives and loves of images. Ranging across the visual arts, literature, and mass media, Mitchell
applies characteristically brilliant and wry analyses to Byzantine icons and cyberpunk films, racial
stereotypes and public monuments, ancient idols and modern clones, offensive images and found objects,
American photography and aboriginal painting. Opening new vistas in iconology and the emergent field of
visual culture, he also considers the importance of Dolly the Sheep—who, as a clone, fulfills the ancient
dream of creating a living image—and the destruction of the World Trade Center on 9/11, which, among
other things, signifies a new and virulent form of iconoclasm.

What Do Pictures Want? offers an immensely rich and suggestive account of the interplay between the
visible and the readable. A work by one of our leading theorists of visual representation, it will be a
touchstone for art historians, literary critics, anthropologists, and philosophers alike.

  “A treasury of episodes—generally overlooked by art history and visual studies—that turn on images that
‘walk by themselves’ and exert their own power over the living.”—Norman Bryson, Artforum
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Segal:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book What Do Pictures Want?: The Lives and Loves of
Images. You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Provided that we know about how is
important the book What Do Pictures Want?: The Lives and Loves of Images. You can add knowledge and
of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can know
everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple
thing until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we can open a book or searching by
internet unit. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's read.

Lorena Repass:

This book untitled What Do Pictures Want?: The Lives and Loves of Images to be one of several books that
best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit into it.
You will easily to buy this specific book in the book retailer or you can order it by way of online. The
publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, since you can read this
book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason for you to past this e-book from your list.

Jennifer Nava:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you could have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try factor that really opposite from
that. 1 activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have
been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love What Do Pictures Want?: The Lives and
Loves of Images, you may enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind
of hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its named
reading friends.

Matthew Sewell:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to select book
like comic, brief story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not trying What Do Pictures Want?:
The Lives and Loves of Images that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied through reading this
book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world considerably
better then how they react towards the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading behavior only for
the geeky person but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all of you who want to
start examining as your good habit, you could pick What Do Pictures Want?: The Lives and Loves of Images
become your own starter.
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