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Li Xuelian, married to Qin Yuhe, is pregnant with their second child. Happy news? Not in China, with its
one-child policy. It is a crime. What is she to do? Her only option is divorcing before the second child is
born.

“Once the baby has entered into the household registry, we’ll marry again. The baby will be born after the
divorce, so we’ll each have one child when we marry again. No law says couples with one child can’t
marry.” Perfect! Except that after the divorce, Qin marries . . . another woman who is expecting a baby. Mad
with rage, Li runs to the judge, begging him to declare the divorce a sham so she may remarry and truly
divorce the fool!

Liu’s politically charged plot reads like an absurd and hilarious comedy, but couched in his fiction is a harsh
indictment of China’s one-child law and a head-on critique of China’s corrupt system. I Did Not Kill My
Husband is storytelling and satire of the highest order, sharp-edged and ironic.
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From reader reviews:

Vincent Baker:

This I Did Not Kill My Husband: A Novel are generally reliable for you who want to certainly be a
successful person, why. The reason of this I Did Not Kill My Husband: A Novel can be among the great
books you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple studying food but feed an individual with
information that perhaps will shock your earlier knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it almost
everywhere and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this I Did Not Kill
My Husband: A Novel forcing you to have an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you
trial run of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day task. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Robert Nguyen:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this I Did Not Kill My Husband: A Novel
guide written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that can be understand by
anyone who also read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and
writing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still skepticism I Did Not Kill My
Husband: A Novel as good book not only by the cover but also by the content. This is one publication that
can break don't determine book by its deal with, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick that!? Oh
come on your examining sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to an additional sixth
sense.

Daniel Padilla:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This book I Did Not Kill My Husband: A Novel was bright colored
and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book I Did Not Kill My Husband: A Novel has many
kinds or variety. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read
and feel that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it makes
you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading that.

Alfredo Dunn:

Book is one of source of expertise. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen have to have book to know the change information of year for you to year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around
the world. By the book I Did Not Kill My Husband: A Novel we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to
definitely be creative people? Being creative person must prefer to read a book. Simply choose the best book
that acceptable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this time book I Did Not Kill
My Husband: A Novel. You can more pleasing than now.
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